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Jean Baptist Dorion Fur Trade Contract 
 By Leah Dorion and Lawrence Barkwell 
 

The fur trade contract shown below was signed by Jean Baptiste Dorion in October 
of 1838. In 1825, he married Thérèse Constant, a Métisse, at The Pas Mission. As this 
contract shows he went back to the Missouri River area, but later the family settled at 
Cumberland House. 
 

Jean-Baptiste Dorion (1800-1889) was the son of Pierre Dorion, a Metis and Marie 
de l’Iowa, a Shoshoni. Jean Baptiste was documented as being born in 1800, on the 
Missouri River and came into the northwest to continue life as a voyageur. As per family 
tradition, he contracted out his labour to various companies as a free trader. He was also 
multilingual and could speak French, Sioux, Iowa and English. 

 
Jean-Baptiste Dorion was one of the first Missouri River Metis to go through the 

Great Lakes trade system, then through the Red River region, then the Mackenzie trade 
region and eventually into Cumberland House, which later became his permanent home. 
Jean-Baptiste Dorion explained his longtime career on the 1887 Half-Breed scrip 
application, which states that: “I lived when young in Missouri and afterward at 
Columbia River, then I came in Mackenzie River District also at Athabasca River, then in 
Cumberland District where I lived at Grand Rapids on the 15th of July 1870 and here at 
Cumberland House for the last 15 years” (National Archives of Canada, Scrip 
Applications). 
 

In 1820 and 1821 he was hired a NWC voyageur at the Lac Népigon and Lac des Iles 
posts, both located north of Lake Superior. He later held a contract with the HBC as a 
steersman in the Cumberland District and held an account at the Cumberland House post 
in 1822 (HBCA F.4/26). At that time he worked on York boats with other men such as 
Alexis McKay, Michel Lavallé, Pierre Carriere, Marken Lavalle, Amable Lucier and 
Isidore Fleury. In the 1830s he worked for the HBC intermittently as a middleman and 
steersman. Upon his arrival in what is now Northern Manitoba, Jean-Baptiste (John) 
Dorion married Thérèse Constant at the Le Pas Mission in 1825. Thérèse Constant was a 
Metis woman born in 1810, and raised in the community of Le Pas. The Constant family 
had extensive family relations in the fur trade community of Grand Rapids and was 
connected to the northern HBC trading system. Jean-Baptiste and Thérèse had seven 
children together. Upon his legal marriage, the Northern Saskatchewan River system 
became his permanent home. The Dorion family is recorded in the Grand Rapids post 
accounts for 1858 that lists Joseph Atkinson, John Ballendine, Edward Cook, Charles 
Fidler, John and Pierriche Dorion, John Stove, and Philip Turner as holding accounts.1 
The many children of Jean Baptiste Dorion and Thérèse Constant continued to work in 
Cumberland House and parts of northern Manitoba as freemen, labourers, and 
interpreters, guides, middlemen and York boat employees. However, the family was 
establishing regular permanent residency at Grand Rapids, The Pas, and Cumberland 
House and intermarried with Scottish-English Metis.  

                                                 
1 See the H.B.C.A, B.49/d/83, Cumberland House Account Book, 1858/1859, mf. 1M462. 
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This contract was provided to Louis Riel Institute by Dr. Tanis Thorne, Department 
of History, University of California, Irvine. Dr. Thorne was a contributor to Metis 
Legacy: A Metis Historiography and Annotated Bibliography, L. J. Barkwell, L. M. 
Dorion and D. R. Préfontaine (Eds.). Winnipeg and Saskatoon: Pemmican Publications, 
Louis Riel Institute and Gabriel Dumont Institute, 2001. 
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